




















ORDINANCE NO. 854 

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING TITLE 1, CHAPTER 12, 

SECTION 12, SUBSECTION B(l) (SEWER RATES AND 

CHARGES) OF THE SHELBY MUNICIPAL CODE 

RECITALS 

WHEREAS, the City of Shelby, Montana (the "City") owns a sewer system (the 

"System") that requires repairs and improvements; and 

WHEREAS, Section 69-7-101, Montana Code Annotated, the City has the power and 

authority to regulate, establish, and change as it considers proper, rates, charges, and 

classifications imposed for utility services to its inhabitants and other persons served by the 

system, so long as those rates, charges, and classification are reasonable and just; and 

WHEREAS, it is necessary to increase the rates and charges for the services provided 

by the System in order to collect sufficient revenues to pay costs associated with the 

maintenance of the System; and 

WHEREAS, the City provided notice to the System's users and opportunity for users 

to be heard as required by Montana law prior to the passage or enactment of an ordinance or 

resolution imposing, establishing, changing or increasing rates, fees, or charges for water 

services or facilities. 

NOW, THEREFORE, be it ordained by the City Council of the City of Shelby, 

Montana as follows: 

SECTION 1. AMENDMENT OF TITLE 1, CHAPTER 12, SECTION 12, SUBSECTION B(l) 

OF THE SHELBY MUNICIPAL CODE 

Title 1, Chapter 12, Section 12, Subsection B(l), of the Shelby Municipal Code is 

hereby amended as follows: 

B. Monthly User's Service Charge.

1. Residential and Nonresidential.

a. The following charges shall become effective as of the July 20, 2024 billing:
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CITY OF SHELBY - POSITION DESCRIPTION 

POSITION: CITY ATTORNEY 

SUPERVISOR: MAYOR AND FINANCE OFFICER 

UPDATED: 5/20/2024 

THIS DESCRIPTION IS INTENDED TO OUTLINE THE GENERAL DUTIES OF THE POSITION. OTHER DUTIES, 

WHICH MAY BE UNRELATED TO THOSE LISTED HEREIN, MAY BE ASSIGNED ON A TEMPORARY OR 

PERMANENT BASIS. THIS IS NOT AN EMPLOYMENT CONTRACT. 

POSITION DUTIES 

Provides professional advice to the City Council and City Officers; makes presentations to councils, boards, 
commissions, civic groups and the general public. Communicates official plans, policies and procedures to staff and 
the general public. Determines work procedures, prepares work schedules, and expedites workflow; studies and 
standardizes procedures to improve efficiency and effectiveness of operations. Issues written and oral instructions 
and opinions; and examines work for exactness, neatness, and conformance to policies and procedures. Prepares a 
variety of studies, reports and related information for decision-making purposes. Assists City Officers to see that all 
laws and ordinances are faithfully performed. Advises the City Council and City Officers of legal conditions and 
current and future trends; issues legal opinions upon proper request(s). Attends all meetings of the Council, 
Administration, and/or boards at which attendance is required; may be asked to attend other meetings on an as 
needed basis. Drafts ordinances, resolutions, contracts, agreements, deeds, leases, franchises, etc.; reviews 
documents prepared by other agencies or parties. Advises city officials of changes to State or Federal laws affecting 
City operations. Oversees the gathering of evidence in civil, criminal, and other cases to formulate defense or to 
initiate legal action. Conducts research, interviews clients, and witnesses and handles other details in preparation for 
trial. Prepares legal briefs, develops strategy, arguments and testimony in preparation for presentation of case. Files 
briefs with court. Represents the City in court, and before quasi-judicial or administrative agencies of government. 
Interprets laws, rulings, and regulations for city officials and staff. Confers with colleagues with specialty in area of 
law to establish and verify basis for legal proceedings; serves as a liaison between outside legal counsel and city 
officials on specialized legal issues. Any other duties as assigned by the Mayor, Finance Officer and Council. 

COURTESY MUST ALWAYS BE SHOWN TO THE PUBLIC, SUPERVISORS AND FELLOW EMPLOYEES 
�� � "" MINIMUM QUALIFICATIONS ·F<;>R THE 'POSITION ' ,,-,,-..-=- -

Graduation from an accredited law school with a Juris Doctor degree in law; and at least three (3) years of 
experience as a practicing attorney. 

Considerable knowledge of state statutes relating to municipal affairs; considerable knowledge of laws relating to the 
purchase of goods and services, contracting, labor, employment, land use, environment and traffic; working 
knowledge of modern policies and practices of municipal law and public administration. 

Skill in preparing briefs and other legal documents; skill in operating a personal computer, including word processing 
and spreadsheet programs; calculator, telephone, copy machine and fax machine. 

Ability to prepare and analyze comprehensive legal documents; ability to carry out assigned projects to their 
completion; ability to communicate effectively verbally and in writing; ability to establish and maintain effective 
working relationships with employees, city officials, the court system, and the general public; ability to efficiently and 
effectively administer a municipal legal department. 

A license to practice law in the State of Montana; member in good standing of the State Bar of Montana; valid 
driver's license, or evidence of equivalent mobility. 

Preference will be given to applicants that have been honorably discharged from a military branch of the United 
States Government. A DD214 could be required for the preference. 

THE CITY MAY ACCEPT WHAT IT DEEMS AN APPROPRIATE COMBINATION OF EDUCATION AND EXPERIENCE 

GENERAL WORKING CONDITIONS 

The position requires good eyesight and manual dexterity, periods of sitting while at a desk, lifting objects that usually 
weigh not more than 20 pounds, and exposure to regular cleaning materials such as floor, window and toilet cleaners. 

ALL CHEMICALS AND OTHER MATERIALS MUST BE USED IN COMPLIANCE WITH SPECIFICATIONS 

CITY OF SHELBY PERSONNEL POLICIES 9. 
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